
List description: Professional women networks in European states other than Baltic Gender members potentially interesting primarily for female scientists 
and engineers working in all fields of (Marine) Science and Technology and STEM 

   

Further National women networks (in 
alphabetical order) 

Link remarks 

Austria     

FEMtech 

https://www.femtech.at/ 

Most comprehensive database of Austrian female 
experts with focus on natural sciences and 
technology. 

(English website: 
https://www.femtech.at/en/femtechs-
database-female-experts) 

Belgium     

BeWiSe – Belgian Women in Science (Belgium) http://www.bewise.be/ 

BeWiSe's main objectives are to support the 
position of women in science, both in public and 
private sectors and to improve communication 
among women in the Belgian and European 
scientific community 

Bulgaria     

https://www.femtech.at/
https://www.femtech.at/en/femtechs-database-female-experts
https://www.femtech.at/en/femtechs-database-female-experts
https://www.femtech.at/en/femtechs-database-female-experts
http://www.bewise.be/


Bulgarian Association of University Women http://bauw-bg.com/en/ 

The Bulgarian Association of University Women 
(BAUW) was founded on the 29th May 1924. Its 
key goals were: bringing together educated women 
and encouraging them to pursue academic and 
public careers, ensuring the closer cooperation 
among them in their professional activities, fighting 
for professional equality between men and women 
and against social injustice, strengthening the 
young people’s education, taking care of female 
university students. 

Greece     

EDEM- Greek Women’s Engineering Association http://www.edem-net.gr/en/edem.html 

EDEM's members are qualified Greek women 
engineers (members of the Technical Chamber of 
Greece). EDEM's  purposes include among others: 
Promoting the principals and create provisions for 
equality between women and men in employment, 
education and society in general. 

Hungary     

Association of Hungarian Women in Science http://www.nokatud.hu Website in Hungarian language. 

Italy     

Donne e Scienza http://www.donnescienza.it/ 

English version available. Associazione Donne e 
Scienza promotes women’s participation in 
scientific research to contribute and generate 
debate on contemporary science with a gender 
perspective. 

http://bauw-bg.com/en/
http://www.nokatud.hu/
http://www.donnescienza.it/


Latvia     

Latvian Women in Science     

The Netherlands     

GAIA-Network for Women in Earth Sciences https://www.gaia-netwerk.nl/home 

GAIA provides women with a background, career 
or interest in Earth Sciences with the opportunity 
to meet and extend their network. GAIA supports 
the (career) development and progression of 
her members. 

Portugal     

Associação Portuguesa de Mulheres 
Cientistas/Portuguese Association of Women in Science 

http://www.amonet.pt/ 

The Portuguese Women Scientists Association 
promotes the equality and full participation of 
portuguese women in all aspects of science, 
including all science, teaching, industry and 
administration. 



Spain     

AMIT- Asociacion de Mujeres Investigadoras y 
Tecnologas 

https://www.amit-es.org/ Website in Spanish language. 

Switzerland     

femdat http://www.femdat.ch/ 

femdat.ch offers ambitious women and female 
academics the most comprehensive network of job 
offers. femdat.ch supports companies and women 
with expertise, network and consulting services in 
their entry, advancement and change. 

 

http://www.femdat.ch/

